G:\M\I9\ZINKE\ZINKE_022. XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 5300

OFFERED BY MR. ZINKE OF MONTANA

At the appropriate place, insert the following:

1 SEC. . AMENDMENTS TO ARMS EXPORT CONTROL ACT.

2 The Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2751 et

3 seq.) is amended—

4 (1) in section 36(a)(10), by striking

5 “$250,000” each place it appears and inserting

6 “$500,0007;

7 (2) in  section 25(a)(1), by striking

8 “$7,000,000” and inserting “$30,000,000";

9 (3) in  section 25(a)(1), by striking

10 “25,000,000” and inserting “105,000,0007’;

11 (4) in sections 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 36(b)(1),

12 35(b)(5)(C), 36(e)(1), and 63(a)(1), by striking

13 “$14,000,000” each place it appears and inserting

14 “$30,000,000";

15 (5) n sections 3(d)(H), 25(a)(1), 36(b)(6)(A),

16 36(c¢)(5)(A) and 63(a)(2), by striking

17 “$25,000,000” each place it appears and inserting

18 “$55,000,000";

19 (6) in sections 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 36(b)(1),

20 36(b)(5)(C), 36(c)(1), 47(6), 63(a)(1), and 71(d), by
g\VHLC\091125\091125.128xml  (1019188I1)

September 11, 2025 (3:50 p.m.)



G:\M\I9\ZINKE\ZINKE_022. XML

2

1 striking “$50,000,000” each place it appears and in-
2 serting “$105,000,000";

3 (7) in  sections  3(d)(H), 36(b)(6)(B),
4 36(¢)(5)(B), and 63(a)(2), by striking
5 “$100,000,000” each place it appears and inserting
6 “$205,000,0007;

7 (8) in sections 36(b)(1), 36(b)(5)(C), and
8 47(6), by striking “$200,000,000” each place it ap-
9 pears and inserting “$410,000,000”; and
10 (9) in  section 36(b)(6)(C), by striking
11 “$300,000,000” and inserting “$615,000,000”.

g\VHLC\091125\091125.128xml  (1019188I1)

September 11, 2025 (3:50 p.m.)




Amendment to H.R. 5300 


Offered by Mr. Zinke of Montana


At the appropriate place, insert the following:


SEC. __. Amendments to Arms Export Control Act.

The Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2751 et seq.) is amended—


(1) in section 36(a)(10), by striking “$250,000” each place it appears and inserting “$500,000”;


(2) in section 25(a)(1), by striking “$7,000,000” and inserting “$30,000,000”;


(3) in section 25(a)(1), by striking “25,000,000” and inserting “105,000,000”;


(4) in sections 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 36(b)(1), 35(b)(5)(C), 36(c)(1), and 63(a)(1), by striking “$14,000,000” each place it appears and inserting “$30,000,000”;


(5) in sections 3(d)(5), 25(a)(1), 36(b)(6)(A), 36(c)(5)(A) and 63(a)(2), by striking “$25,000,000” each place it appears and inserting “$55,000,000”;


(6) in sections 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 36(b)(1), 36(b)(5)(C), 36(c)(1), 47(6), 63(a)(1), and 71(d), by striking “$50,000,000” each place it appears and inserting “$105,000,000”;


(7) in sections 3(d)(5), 36(b)(6)(B), 36(c)(5)(B), and 63(a)(2), by striking “$100,000,000” each place it appears and inserting “$205,000,000”;


(8) in sections 36(b)(1), 36(b)(5)(C), and 47(6), by striking “$200,000,000” each place it appears and inserting “$410,000,000”; and


(9) in section 36(b)(6)(C), by striking “$300,000,000” and inserting “$615,000,000”.



  
   G:\M\19\ZINKE\ZINKE_022.XML XXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX 9/11/2025 15:50 XXXXXXXXX 09/11/2025 12:13 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX   1019188|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to H.R. 5300  
  
 Offered by  Mr. Zinke of Montana 
 
 
   
  At the appropriate place, insert the following:
 
  __. Amendments to Arms Export Control Act The Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2751 et seq.) is amended—
  (1) in section 36(a)(10), by striking  $250,000 each place it appears and inserting  $500,000;
  (2) in section 25(a)(1), by striking  $7,000,000 and inserting  $30,000,000;
  (3) in section 25(a)(1), by striking  25,000,000 and inserting  105,000,000;
  (4) in sections 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 36(b)(1), 35(b)(5)(C), 36(c)(1), and 63(a)(1), by striking  $14,000,000 each place it appears and inserting  $30,000,000;
  (5) in sections 3(d)(5), 25(a)(1), 36(b)(6)(A), 36(c)(5)(A) and 63(a)(2), by striking  $25,000,000 each place it appears and inserting  $55,000,000;
  (6) in sections 3(d)(1), 3(d)(3)(A), 36(b)(1), 36(b)(5)(C), 36(c)(1), 47(6), 63(a)(1), and 71(d), by striking  $50,000,000 each place it appears and inserting  $105,000,000;
  (7) in sections 3(d)(5), 36(b)(6)(B), 36(c)(5)(B), and 63(a)(2), by striking  $100,000,000 each place it appears and inserting  $205,000,000;
  (8) in sections 36(b)(1), 36(b)(5)(C), and 47(6), by striking  $200,000,000 each place it appears and inserting  $410,000,000; and
  (9) in section 36(b)(6)(C), by striking  $300,000,000 and inserting  $615,000,000.
 

