
[118H400] 

..................................................................... 

(Original Signature of Member) 

119TH CONGRESS 
1ST SESSION H. R. ll 

To amend the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 to increase the amount 

that may be invested in small business investment companies. 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Ml. llllll introduced the following bill; which was referred to the 

Committee on llllllllllllll 

A BILL 
To amend the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 to 

increase the amount that may be invested in small busi-

ness investment companies. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-1

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 2

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 3

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Investing in Main 4

Street Act of 2025’’. 5

VerDate Nov 24 2008 14:37 Jan 17, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\MMCROTTY\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\SBIC_INV
January 17, 2025 (2:37 p.m.)

G:\CMTE\SB\19\LOAN\SBIC_INV.XML

g:\V\E\011725\E011725.033.xml           (963964|1)



2 

SEC. 2. INVESTMENT IN SMALL BUSINESS INVESTMENT 1

COMPANIES. 2

Section 302(b) of the Small Business Investment Act 3

of 1958 (15 U.S.C. 682(b)) is amended— 4

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘‘5 percent’’ 5

and inserting ‘‘15 percent’’; and 6

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘‘5 percent’’ 7

and inserting ‘‘15 percent’’. 8

VerDate Nov 24 2008 14:37 Jan 17, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00002 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\MMCROTTY\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\SBIC_INV
January 17, 2025 (2:37 p.m.)

G:\CMTE\SB\19\LOAN\SBIC_INV.XML

g:\V\E\011725\E011725.033.xml           (963964|1)



....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		119th CONGRESS
1st Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 to increase the amount that may be invested in small business investment companies.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

M_. ______ introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 to increase the amount that may be invested in small business investment companies.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Investing in Main Street Act of 2025”.


SEC. 2. Investment in small business investment companies.

Section 302(b) of the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 (15 U.S.C. 682(b)) is amended—


(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “5 percent” and inserting “15 percent”; and


(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “5 percent” and inserting “15 percent”.






  
    G:\CMTE\SB\19\LOAN\SBIC_INV.XML XXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 1/17/2025 14:37 XXXXXXXX 01/17/2025 2:32 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX   963964|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
   [118H400] 
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
 M_. ______ introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 to increase the amount that may be invested in small business investment companies. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Investing in Main Street Act of 2025.
  2. Investment in small business investment companies Section 302(b) of the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 (15 U.S.C. 682(b)) is amended—
  (1) in paragraph (1), by striking  5 percent and inserting  15 percent; and
  (2) in paragraph (2), by striking  5 percent and inserting  15 percent.
 


