G:\CMTE\VA\I8\R\EO\ED_ASST_JOB_PAY.XML

118TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION H. R.

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the amount of educational
assistance paid by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs to an eligible indi-
vidual during the first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship
or other on-job training.

(Original Signature of Member)

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. VAN ORDEN introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on

A BILL

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the
amount of educational assistance paid by the Secretary
of Veterans Affairs to an eligible individual during the
first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship or

other on-job training.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

2

3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “Warriors to Workforce
5

g:\VHLD\052124\D052124.026.xml (86071913)
May 21, 2024 (10:50 a.m.)



G:\CMTE\VA\I§\R\EO\ED_ASST JOB_PAY.XML

2

1 SEC. 2. INCREASE OF AMOUNT OF EDUCATIONAL ASSIST-
2 ANCE PAID BY THE SECRETARY OF VET-
3 ERANS AFFAIRS FOR FIRST YEAR OF A FULL-
4 TIME PROGRAM OF APPRENTICESHIP OR
5 OTHER ON-JOB TRAINING.

6 Section 3313(2)(3)(B) of title 38, United States
7 Code, is amended—

8 (1) in the matter preceding clause (i), by insert-
9 ing “‘using educational assistance under this chap-
10 ter”’; and
11 (2) in clause (1)(II), by striking “80 percent”
12 and inserting “90 percent”.

g:\VHLD\052124\D052124.026.xm (86071913)

May 21, 2024 (10:50 a.m.)




....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		118th CONGRESS
2d Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the amount of educational assistance paid by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs to an eligible individual during the first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship or other on-job training.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. Van Orden introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on _______________




A BILL

To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the amount of educational assistance paid by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs to an eligible individual during the first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship or other on-job training.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Warriors to Workforce Act”. 


SEC. 2. Increase of amount of educational assistance paid by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs for first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship or other on-job training.

Section 3313(g)(3)(B) of title 38, United States Code, is amended—


(1) in the matter preceding clause (i), by inserting “using educational assistance under this chapter”; and


(2) in clause (i)(II), by striking “80 percent” and inserting “90 percent”.






  
    G:\CMTE\VA\18\R\EO\ED_ASST_JOB_PAY.XML XXXXX XXXXXXX 5/21/2024 10:50 XXXXXX 01/03/2023 12:24 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXX 
  860719|3
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
    
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Mr. Van Orden introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on _______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend title 38, United States Code, to increase the amount of educational assistance paid by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs to an eligible individual during the first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship or other on-job training. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Warriors to Workforce Act. 
  2. Increase of amount of educational assistance paid by the Secretary of Veterans Affairs for first year of a full-time program of apprenticeship or other on-job training Section 3313(g)(3)(B) of title 38, United States Code, is amended— 
  (1) in the matter preceding clause (i), by inserting  using educational assistance under this chapter; and 
  (2) in clause (i)(II), by striking  80 percent and inserting  90 percent. 
 


