
Amendment #1* 

Amendment to H.R. 5001 
Offered by Rep. Neguse 

 
 
 
Page 2, after line 6, insert the following and redesignate the paragraphs accordingly: 

(2) in subsection (b)(1), by striking “$179,000,000” and inserting “$184,000,000”; 

(3) in subsection (b)(2), by striking “$30,000,000” and inserting “$25,000,000”; 

 


