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Mr. Delmar is an attorney with over 40 years of federal and military experience.  
Currently, he serves as the Acting Inspector General of the Treasury, and leads 240 
auditors, investigators, program analysts, attorneys, and support professionals in the 
oversight of Treasury programs and operations. He has led the expansion of 
professional staffing and development of audit and investigative protocols to provide 
oversight of new pandemic-related fund disbursement programs, successfully managing 
the transition of the office to a completely remote work environment in response to the 
COVID-19 pandemic, despite undertaking significantly expanded oversight jurisdiction 
and assuring continuation of existing oversight responsibilities. He also supported the 
stand-up and operation of the Pandemic Response Accountability Committee (PRAC) 
established by the Coronavirus Aid, Relief, and Economic Security Act to bring together 
the Inspectors General of affected federal agencies.  
  
Mr. Delmar brings significant experience to his role as Acting Inspector General, a role 
he has filled since 2019, having been Counsel to the Inspector General since 1999. In 
that capacity, he provided comprehensive legal services to the investigative, audit, 
management and Equal Employment Opportunity programs of Treasury Office of 
Inspector General (OIG) advising on audit standards, criminal law and procedure, 
procurement law, personnel law, and other statutes, regulations, and policies relevant to 
OIG operations and Treasury programs. 
  
As Deputy Inspector General, he has individually conducted special inquiries responsive 
to Congressional, Intelligence Community, and Office of Special Counsel requests.  
  
Prior to his appointment as Counsel and Deputy Inspector General, he spent 10 years 
as a Technical Assistant and Branch Chief with the Criminal Tax Division in the Internal 
Revenue Service (IRS) Office of Chief Counsel, where he reviewed proposed criminal 
tax prosecutions and provided training to investigators and attorneys on tax, money 
laundering, Bank Secrecy Act, and forfeiture law, in addition to supervising attorney 
staff.  
  
Mr. Delmar has also served as a Trial Attorney with the IRS Office of Chief Counsel and 
the Tax Division of the Department of Justice. He is retired from the Judge Advocate 
General’s Corps, U.S. Navy Reserve.  
  
Mr. Delmar is a graduate of Georgetown University and the New York University School 
of Law.  
 


	pdf cover
	Slide Number 1

	REFORMATTED HOAC FINAL
	Delmar Bio



