G:\M\INSELR\SELF_093. XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 5300

OFFERED BY MR. SELF OF TEXAS
At the appropriate place, insert the following:

1 SEC. . ARMS EXPORT CONTROL ACT AMENDMENTS.

2 Section 36 of the Arms Export Control Act (22
3 U.S.C.2776) is amended—
4 (1) in subsection (a), by inserting “(or, in the
5 case of a defense article that is a firearm controlled
6 under category I of the United States Munitions
7 List, $4,000,000 or more)” after “$1,000,000 or
8 more’’ each place it appears; and
9 (2) in subsection (c¢), by striking “$1,000,000”
10 and inserting “$4,000,000".

g:\VAH\091525\H091525.066.xml  (102127512)

September 15, 2025 (5:52 p.m.)




Amendment to H.R. 5300


Offered by Mr. Self of Texas


At the appropriate place, insert the following:


SEC. __. Arms Export Control Act amendments.

Section 36 of the Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2776) is amended—


(1) in subsection (a), by inserting “(or, in the case of a defense article that is a firearm controlled under category I of the United States Munitions List, $4,000,000 or more)” after “$1,000,000 or more” each place it appears; and


(2) in subsection (c), by striking “$1,000,000” and inserting “$4,000,000”.



  
   G:\M\19\SELF\SELF_093.XML  XXXXXXXXX 9/15/2025 17:51 XXXXXXXXX 09/15/2025 5:45 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXX 
  1021275|2
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to H.R. 5300 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Self of Texas 
  
 
 
    
  At the appropriate place, insert the following: 
  
  __. Arms Export Control Act amendments Section 36 of the Arms Export Control Act (22 U.S.C. 2776) is amended— 
  (1) in subsection (a), by inserting  (or, in the case of a defense article that is a firearm controlled under category I of the United States Munitions List, $4,000,000 or more) after  $1,000,000 or more each place it appears; and 
  (2) in subsection (c), by striking  $1,000,000 and inserting  $4,000,000. 
 

