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Margaret (Margie) McGlynn has served as President and Chief Executive Officer of the 
International AIDS Vaccine Initiative (IAVI) since July of 2011.  IAVI is a Product 
Development Partnership that was founded in 1996 to fill gaps and help accelerate HIV 
vaccine R&D by bridging government and philanthropic funding with academic and 
industry capabilities. 
 
Margie brings significant experience in the vaccine and antiretroviral markets. She 
retired from Merck in 2009, after 26 years with the company, last serving as President, 
Global Vaccines and Anti-Infectives. In that capacity, Margie was responsible for a  $7 
billion portfolio of products globally, and oversaw the launch of several vaccines, 
including Merck’s rotavirus and HPV vaccines, and anti-infectives including an integrase 
inhibitor for HIV.  Over the course of her career at Merck, Margie played a prominent 
role in the company’s global health initiatives and drug and vaccine access programs. 
She was involved in the provision of Merck’s HIV drugs and vaccines at cost to 
developing countries, and was responsible for access programs for Rotavirus and HPV 
vaccines in low-income countries. Margie served on the board and executive committee 
of the GAVI Alliance, a public-private partnership dedicated to bringing life-saving 
vaccines against common infectious diseases to people across the developing world. 
While at Merck, she also played a key role in establishing the Hilleman Laboratories, a 
partnership between Merck and the Wellcome Trust, headquartered in New Delhi, 
India, that focuses on the development of vaccines for the developing world.  Margie 
also served as a member of CSIS Commission on Global Health in 2009 and 2010. 
 
Prior to her role leading the Global Vaccine Business, Margie held numerous roles in 
sales, marketing and managed care at Merck.  Her experience spanned multiple product 
lines, including primary care, specialty products, vaccines and hospital products.  She 
also served in both domestic and global roles, and she held a number of senior level 
positions leading the U.S. Hospital and Specialty Products Division, the U. S. Sales and 
Managed Care Organization, Global Marketing and the Health and Utilization 
Management area for Merck Medco Managed Care.  
 
Margie attended the State University of New York at Buffalo, where she completed a 
dual major, receiving a bachelor’s degree in Pharmacy and an MBA in Marketing. 


