F:\R\1 14\RH\S501_RH.XML H.L.C.

Union Calendar No.

1141H CONGRESS
1ST SESSION S. O 1

[Report No. 114-]

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES
May 22, 2015
Referred to the Committee on Natural Resources

JULy --, 2015

Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State of the Union,
and ordered to be printed

fA\VHLC\071715\071715.053.xml
July 17,2015 (11:36 a.m.)



F:\R\1 14\RH\S501_RH.XML H.L.C.

A BILL

To make technical corrections to the Navajo water rights
settlement in the State of New Mexico, and for other

purposes.

fA\VHLC\071715\071715.053.xml
July 17,2015 (11:36 a.m.)



F:\R\1 14\RH\S501_RH.XML H.L.C.

O o0 N N W B W =

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
DN = O 00N N R WD = O

23

3
Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “New Mexico Navajo

Water Settlement Technical Corrections Act”’.

SEC. 2. NAVAJO WATER SETTLEMENT.

(a) DEFINITIONS.—Section 10302 of the Omnibus

Public Land Management Act of 2009 (43 U.S.C. 407

note; Public Law 111-11) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘“Arrellano”
and inserting ““Arellano’; and

(2) in paragraph (27), by striking “75-185"
and inserting “75-184".

(b) DELIVERY AND USE OF NAVAJO-GALLUP WATER

SUPPLY PROJECT WATER.—Section 10603(¢)(2)(A) of
the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Pub-
lic Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1385) is amended—

(1) in eclause (i), by striking “Article III(c)”
and inserting “Articles I1I(¢)”; and

(2) in clause (11)(II), by striking “Article III(c)”
and inserting “Articles I1I(¢)”.

(¢) PROJECT CONTRACTS.—Section 10604(f)(1) of

the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Pub-

24 lic Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1391) is amended by inserting

25

“Project” before “water”.

f:\WHLC\071715\071715.053.xml

July 17,2015 (11:36 a.m.)



F:\R\1 14\RH\S501_RH.XML H.L.C.
4

1 (d) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section
10609 of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of
2009 (Public Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1395) is amended—

(1) in paragraphs (1) and (2) of subsection (b),

by striking ‘“construction or rehabilitation” each

2
3
4
5
6 place it appears and inserting “‘planning, design,
7 construction, rehabilitation,”;
8 (2) in subsection (e)(1), by striking “2 percent”
9 and inserting “4 percent’’; and
10 (3) in subsection (f)(1), by striking “4 percent”
11 and inserting “2 percent’’.
12 () AGREEMENT.—Section 10701(e) of the Omnibus
13 Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111-
14 11; 123 Stat. 1400) is amended in paragraphs (2)(A),
15 (2)(B), and (3)(A) by striking “and Contract” each place

16 it appears.

fA\VHLC\071715\071715.053.xml
July 17,2015 (11:36 a.m.)




  
   F:\R\114\RH\S501_RH.XML 7/17/2015 11:36   
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
 
  
 I 
 Union Calendar No.  
 114th CONGRESS 1st Session 
 S. 501 
 [Report No. 114–] 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
 May 22, 2015 
 Referred to the  Committee on Natural Resources 
 
  
 July --, 2015 
 Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State of the Union, and ordered to be printed  
 
 A BILL 
 To make technical corrections to the Navajo water rights settlement in the State of New Mexico, and for other purposes.  
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the “New Mexico Navajo Water Settlement Technical Corrections Act”.  
  2. Navajo water settlement 
  (a) Definitions Section 10302 of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (43 U.S.C. 407 note; Public Law 111–11) is amended— 
  (1) in paragraph (2), by striking  Arrellano and inserting  Arellano; and  
  (2) in paragraph (27), by striking  75–185 and inserting  75–184.  
  (b) Delivery and use of Navajo-Gallup water supply project water Section 10603(c)(2)(A) of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111–11; 123 Stat. 1385) is amended— 
  (1) in clause (i), by striking  Article III(c) and inserting  Articles III(c); and  
  (2) in clause (ii)(II), by striking  Article III(c) and inserting  Articles III(c).  
  (c) Project contracts Section 10604(f)(1) of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111–11; 123 Stat. 1391) is amended by inserting  Project before  water.  
  (d) Authorization of appropriations Section 10609 of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111–11; 123 Stat. 1395) is amended— 
  (1) in paragraphs (1) and (2) of subsection (b), by striking  construction or rehabilitation each place it appears and inserting  planning, design, construction, rehabilitation,;  
  (2) in subsection (e)(1), by striking  2 percent and inserting  4 percent; and  
  (3) in subsection (f)(1), by striking  4 percent and inserting  2 percent.  
  (e) Agreement Section 10701(e) of the Omnibus Public Land Management Act of 2009 (Public Law 111–11; 123 Stat. 1400) is amended in paragraphs (2)(A), (2)(B), and (3)(A) by striking  and Contract each place it appears. 
 
  
  
  


